

PERINTON RECREATION AND PARKS  
WEARING APPAREL BID RESULTS 2019

ITEM #		Laux Sporting Goods	BSN Sports	elifeguard	Will Enterprises	The Lifeguard Store	All Star Custom Apparel	4Imprint	Pop Tops	WB Mason	Mugs N More	Express Press	winning bid
1	Delivered Cost	No Bids	\$3,573.00	No Bids	\$2,852.00	No Bids	\$3,496.00	\$3,490.80	\$2,888.00	\$4,351.60	\$2,208.00	\$2,833.60	\$2,208.00
2	Delivered Cost		\$5,228.32		\$2,362.80		\$5,878.36	\$6,041.36	\$3,372.36	\$4,310.32	\$2,291.20	\$2,921.28	\$2,291.20
3	Delivered Cost		\$356.40		\$223.20		\$358.56	\$288.72	\$252.72	\$321.84	\$190.80	\$221.76	\$190.80
4	Delivered Cost		\$132.00		\$74.40		\$133.44	\$122.88	\$111.84	\$189.12	\$63.60	\$73.92	\$63.60
5	Delivered Cost		\$1,045.20		\$752.40		\$945.60	\$101.60	\$984.00	\$964.80	\$696.00	\$751.20	\$696.00
6	Delivered Cost		\$390.95		\$751.00		\$387.20	\$500.80	\$422.00	\$508.00	\$248.00	\$318.80	\$248.00
7	Delivered Cost		\$1,171.77		\$789.30		\$940.41	\$1,115.37	\$1,012.30	\$991.44	\$704.70	\$764.44	\$704.70
8	Delivered Cost		\$759.60		\$511.50		\$704.55	\$677.65	\$554.40	\$653.47	\$286.00	\$508.20	\$286.00
9	Delivered Cost		\$529.52		\$587.00		\$664.56	\$878.80	\$468.00	\$655.20	\$494.00	\$668.96	\$494.00
10	Delivered Cost		\$882.96		\$840.00		\$820.08	\$870.00	\$867.60	\$873.60	\$570.00	\$651.60	\$570.00
11	Delivered Cost		\$580.05		\$540.54		\$547.05	\$1,057.35	\$677.10	\$772.80	\$341.25	\$560.70	\$341.25
12	Delivered Cost		\$1,207.32		\$648.68		\$696.96	\$1,324.24	\$873.84	\$976.80	\$462.00	\$678.48	\$462.00
13	Delivered Cost		\$613.80		\$338.40		\$360.36	\$664.62	\$448.92	\$650.10	\$231.00	\$445.56	\$231.00
14	Delivered Cost		\$963.80		\$608.00		\$596.58	\$1,228.54	\$819.84	\$866.20	\$427.00	\$627.08	\$427.00
15	Delivered Cost		\$390.60		\$209.58		\$223.86	\$422.94	\$282.24	\$422.94	\$147.00	\$215.88	\$147.00
16	Delivered Cost		\$1,776.00		\$1,530.00		\$1,791.90	\$1,423.80	\$1,610.70	\$1,561.50	\$1,467.00	\$1,110.30	\$1,467.00
17	Delivered Cost		\$469.50		\$480.00		\$547.50	\$474.60	\$492.90	\$557.10	\$420.00	\$326.70	\$420.00
18	Delivered Cost		\$842.00		\$419.00		\$662.20	\$627.00	\$515.60	\$807.40	\$319.00	\$504.60	\$319.00
19	Delivered Cost		\$985.50		\$540.00		\$752.40	\$786.60	\$751.20	\$866.70	\$427.50	\$600.90	\$427.50
Total Items 1-19		\$0.00	\$21,898.29	\$0.00	\$15,057.80	\$0.00	\$20,507.57	\$22,097.67	\$17,405.56	\$21,300.93	\$11,994.05	\$14,783.96	\$11,994.05

PERINTON RECREATION AND PARKS  
WEARING APPAREL BID RESULTS 2019

ITEM #		Laux Sporting Goods	BSN Sports	elifeguard	Will Enterprises	The Lifeguard Store	All Star Custom Apparel	4Imprint	4Imprint	WB Mason	Mugs N More	Express Press	winning bid
20	Delivered Cost	No Bids	No Bids	\$204.62	No Bids	\$260.00	\$292.50	No Bid	\$395.59	No Bids	No Bid	No Bid	\$204.62
21	Delivered Cost			\$638.08		\$896.00	\$1,120.00	No Bid	\$1,302.40		No Bid	No Bid	\$638.08
22	Delivered Cost			\$757.72		\$950.00	\$1,330.00	No Bid	\$1,546.60		No Bid	No Bid	\$757.72
23	Delivered Cost					\$608.00	\$297.16	No Bid	\$837.90		\$387.00	No Bid	No Order
24	Delivered Cost					\$750.00	\$739.50	No Bid	\$966.90		\$600.00	No Bid	\$600.00
25	Delivered Cost					No Bid	\$270.00	\$305.00	\$390.00		\$320.00	\$272.90	\$272.90
Total Items 20 - 25				\$1,600.42							\$600.00	\$272.90	\$2,473.32
Grand Total per company				\$1,600.42							\$12,594.05	\$272.90	\$14,467.37

The first package for items 1 through 19. **Items 1-19 \$11,994.05**  
 Items 20 - 25 awarded as separate items. **Item 20: \$204.62**  
**Item 21: \$638.08**  
**Item 22: \$757.72**  
**Item 23: No Order**  
**Item 24: \$600.00**  
**Item 25: \$272.90**